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SALOMON  INC – A report by the Chairman on the Company’s 
Position  and Outlook  
Source -  Asian  Wall St Journal . 1st, November, 1991 (Advertisement ) 
 
 
 
To the Shareholders of Salomon Inc: 
 
In this report, I want not only to tell you about Salomon Inc's third-quarter results but also 
to give you my thinking as to where the company must head. 
 
From announcements we have made and from the media you have learned about the 
events that led to my appointment as interim Chairman of Salomon Inc on August 18. We 
have since continued to investigate Salomon's past actions in the Government securities 
market and in other areas as well. Our conclusion so far: A few Salomon employees 
behaved egregiously-a fact that will prove costly to you as shareholders-but the 
misconduct and misjudgments were limited to those few. In short, I believe that we had 
an extremely serious problem, but not a pervasive one. 
 
 ....... CONTROLS AND COMPLIANCE  
 
Since August 18, we have installed rules and procedures at Salomon Brothers Inc, our 
securities subsidiary, that we think set a standard for the industry. In addition, we have 
begun to monitor what goes on in Salomon Brothers in new ways-for example, by 
setting up a Compliance Committee of the Board-and expect in that area also to be a 
leader. Even so, an atmosphere encouraging exemplary behavior is probably even more 
important than rules, necessary though these are. During my tenure as Chairman, I will 
consider myself the firm's chief compliance officer and I have asked all 9,000 of 
Salomon's employees to assist me in that effort. I have also urged them to be guided by a 
test that goes beyond rules: Contemplating any business act, an employee should ask 
himself whether he would be willing to see it immediately described by an informed and 
critical reporter on the front page of his local paper, there to be read by his spouse, 
children and friends. At Salomon we simply want no part of any activities that pass legal 
tests but that we, as citizens, would find offensive. 
 
 . . . . . . . . . . OPERATING RESULTS . . . . . . . . . . 
 
Ordinary operations during the third quarter produced excellent profits, in large part 
because of exceptionally favorable trends in the fixed-income markets. I need to alert you, 
however, to two major adjustments that affected the bottom line, one negatively, one 
positively. 
 
In the first instance, we have set up a pre-tax legal reserve of $200 million for potential 
settlements, judgments, penalties, fines, litigation expense and other related costs. In the 
second instance, the compensation expense we have recorded for Salomon Brothers is 
about $110 million less than what might normally be expected. Because certain legal 
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costs may not be deductible for tax purposes, different tax rates apply to the two unusual 
items. Their combined effect, therefore, was a reduction in net income of about $75 
million. 
 
         LEGAL COSTS . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
 
I would like to elaborate on each of these unusual items, beginning with legal costs. No 
one can now estimate with any degree of certainty what the eventual direct costs of 
Salomon's past misdeeds and misjudgments will be to the company. (There are also very 
important secondary costs, such as loss of business and increased funding, costs; but, as I 
shall detail later, there may additionally be' secondary benefits, perhaps substantial.). 
Whatever these costs are , however, our large equity base - $ 4 billion – virtually insures 
that they will not be crippling.  
 
We will pay any fines or penalties with dispatch and we will also try to settle valid legal 
claims promptly. However, we will litigate invalid or inflated claims, of which there will 
be many, to whatever extent necessary. That is, we will make appropriate amends for past 
conduct but we will be no one's patsy. 
 
Accounting rules require that we review the size of our reserve with Our auditors and 
counsel. That has been, done and-based on the limited amount of information presently 
available-they agree with the present estimate. We will make upward or downward 
adjustments to the reserve ~s information and events clarify the situation. 
 
 ............ COMPENSATION  
 
Most of you have read articles about the high levels of compensation at Salomon 
Brothers. Some of you have also read discussions of incentive compensation that I have 
written in the Berkshire Hathaway annual report. In those, I have said that I believe a 
rational incentive compensation plan to be an excellent way to reward managers, and I 
have also embraced the concept of truly extraordinary pay for extraordinary managerial 
performance. I continue to subscribe to those views. But the problem at Salomon 
Brothers has been a compensation plan that was irrational in certain crucial respects. 
One irrationality has been compensation levels that overall have been too high in relation 
to overall results. For example, last year the securities unit earned about 10% oil equity 
capital-far tinder the average earned by American business-yet 106 individuals who 
worked for the unit earned $1 million or more. Many of these people pet-formed 
exceedingly well and clearly deserved their pay. But the overall result made no sense: 
Though 1990 operating profits. before compensation were flat versus 1989, pay jumped 
by more than $120 million. And that, of course, meant earnings for shareholders fell by 
the same amount. 
 
A related irrationality is connected to the lopsided way in which Salomon has earned its 
profits-a matter, indeed, on which Salomon's directors were not supplied sufficient 
information. The data I now have available show that Salomon's lackluster overall profits 
of recent years resulted from a combination of excellent earnings in a few areas of the 
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business-operating in an honest and ethical manner, it should be added-with 
inadequate or non-existent earnings at the remainder. Yet the compensation plan did not 
take this extreme unevenness into account. In effect, the fine performance of some 
People Subsidized truly out-sized rewards for others. It would  be understandable if a 
private partnership opted For such all egalitarian, share-the-wealth system. But Salomon 
is a publicly owned company depending on vast amounts of shareholders' capital. In such 
an operation, it is appropriate that the excess earnings of' the exceptional performers-that 
is, what they generate beyond what they are justly paid-go to the stockholders. 
 
Of course, it is difficult to quantify performance in many vital jobs, such as compliance, 
audit, funding, and research. For these activities, and for operational and support jobs as 
well, Salomon employees should normally be paid in line with industry standards, 
whether profits are high or low. Our compensation plans must also both reward 
cooperative, for-the-good-of-the-firm behavior and recognize that some business units 
earn relatively little in profits but deliver valuable, if hard to quantify, collateral benefits 
to the firm. 
All that said, there remain many jobs for which performance can be concretely measured 
and ought to, be. In these, employees who produce exceptional results for the firm, while 
operating both honorably and without excessive risk, should expect to receive first-class 
compensation. On the other hand, employees producing mediocre returns for owners 
should expect their pay to reflect this shortfall. In the past that has neither been the 
expectation at Salomon nor the practice. 
 
Salomon Inc's directors have decided that total compensation at Salomon Brothers in 
1991 will be slightly below the level of 1990. Through June 30, 1991, however, 
compensation accruals had been made at a rate that considerably exceeded 1990's. 
Therefore, a $110 million downward adjustment of the accrual was made in the third 
quarter. 
 
In 1991 and in the future, the top-paid people at Salomon Brothers will get much of their 
compensation in the form of stock, pursuant to the Equity Partnership Plat] (EPP), which 
previous management instituted last year and which we heartily applaud. The EPP 
motivates managers to think like owners, since it obliges them to hold the stock they buy 
for at least five years and therefore exposes them to the risks of the business as well as 
the opportunities. Contrast this arrangement with stock-option plans, in which managers 
commit money only if the game has already been won and then often move quickly to 
sell their shares. 
 
In Salomon Brothers' business, which combines leverage with earnings volatility, it is 
particularly necessary and appropriate that the financial equation applying personally to 
managers be comparable to that applying to the ordinary shareholder. We wish to see the 
unit's managers become wealthy through ownership, not by simply free-riding on the 
ownership of others, I think in fact that ownership can in time bring our best managers 
substantial wealth, perhaps in amounts well beyond what they now think possible. 
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To avoid dilution, the trustee of the EPP purchases stock for the plan in the market and at 
some point in the future the company may itself elect to make stock repurchases to 
reduce the shares outstanding. Within a relatively few years Salomon Inc's  key 
employees could own 25% or more of the business, purchased with their own 
compensation. The better job each employee does for the company, the more stock he or 
she will own. 
 
Our pay-for-performance philosophy will undoubtedly cause some managers to leave. 
But very importantly, this same philosophy may induce the top performers to stay, since 
these people may identify themselves as .350 hitters about to be paid appropriately 
instead of seeing their just rewards partially assigned to lesser performers. Indeed, I am 
pleased to report that certain of our very best managers have already asked that the EPP 
be modified to allow them to substantially increase the proportion of their earnings that 
can be invested through the plan. 
 
Were an abnormal number of people to leave the firm, the results would not necessarily 
be bad. Other men and women who share our thinking and values would then be given 
added responsibilities and opportunities. In the end we must have people to match our 
principles, not the reverse. 
 
 .............. LEVERAGE  
 
Our September 30th balance sheet totals are down by over $37 billion from those of June 
30th-from $134 billion to $97 billion. The pace of change, however, has been even more 
dramatic than these figures indicate: Total assets on August 16, just before I became 
Chairman, were about $150 billion. 
 
In Salomon Brothers' business, I should point out, substantial amounts of' borrowed  
money are necessary and proper. We will continue, for example, to make large, short- 
term commitments to finance under-writings and block-purchases of equities, mortgages 
and bonds. Indeed, we expect to be a leader in these fields. 
 
Nonetheless, we have deliberately brought our balance sheet totals down to reduce our 
leverage, and you will see the totals come down further in the months ahead. I am no fan 
of huge leverage in general, and in Salomon's case I believe that the swelling of the 
balance sheet that took place in the past was often done for the sake of all-too-marginal 
returns. Larger totals can actually lead to smaller profits: Undisciplined decision-making 
is a frequent consequence of ultra-easy access to funding, as both commercial and 
investment banks have learned in recent years. 
 
One final, reassuring point about the balance sheet: Salomon's previous management 
strongly favored conservative reserving. Significant allowances for various risks of the 
business have been-and will be-maintained. 
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. . . . . . . . . . . . PHIBRO ENERGY . . . . . . . . . . . . 
 
Phibro, the other major business owned by Salomon Inc, is achieving only mediocre 
profits this year after a terrific performance in 1990. Many investors recognize Phibro as 
a world leader in the trading of oil and related derivative instruments but are unaware of 
the magnitude of Phibro's oil refinery business. Phibro's four refineries typically process 
about 330,000 barrels of oil per day, which is equal to more than a third of the U.S. 
refining output of Exxon. But refining spreads this year have been narrow and Phibro's 
profits from this business have fallen sharply. 
 
The company has made excellent progress, however, with White Nights (WNJE), its 
Siberian oil project, in which our Russian partner is Varyeganneftegaz Production 
Association. I have met with Anatoli Sivak, the talented Director General of 
Varyeganneftegaz and Chairman of WNJE, and share his enthusiasm about developments 
to date. 
 
Essentially, this venture is drilling new wells and reworking existing wells in three 
designated fields. In payment, it is entitled to the incremental output it succeeds in 
producing over what the output would have been had WNJE's development not occurred. 
 
To date, WNJE has undertaken 37 workovers, of which 25 were successful. Additionally, 
one new well has recently been completed. In aggregate, these wells have increased 
production by about 4,700 barrels per day. WNJE is receiving hard currency for its oil 
and the pace of drilling will accelerate. Though the project entails political and petroleum 
engineering risks, WNJE's potential is large. 
 
. . . . . . . . . . . . . CONCLUSION . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
 
In recent years both Salomon Inc, the parent, and Phibro Energy have been treated by top 
management as adjuncts to Salomon Brothers. That was understandable, given that the 
managers of the parent came from the securities unit. Now, however, we are viewing 
Salomon Inc as the owner of two independent and substantial businesses, each of which 
will be measured by return on the equity capital it requires. 
 
I noted earlier that there may well be future benefits that arise from our current problems. 
We have the prospect of correcting certain weaknesses at Salomon Brothers that were 
likely to remain unaddressed absent a change in management; meanwhile, the firm's 
strengths in large part remain intact. Though earnings volatility will always be high, 
Salomon Inc has the capacity amid favorable market conditions to earn substantial slims. 
Furthermore, I believe that we can earn these Superior returns playing aggressively in the 
center of the court, without resorting to close-to-the-line acrobatics. Good profits simply 
are not inconsistent with good behavior. 
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Our goal is going to be that stated many decades ago by  J.P. Morgan, who wished to see 
his bank transact "first-class business-in a first-class way." We will judge ourselves in 
fact not only by the business we do, but also by the business we decline to do. As is the 
case at all large organizations, there will be mistakes at Salomon and even failures, but to 
the best of our ability we will acknowledge our errors quickly and correct them with 
equal promptness. 
 
The best decision I have made since assuming my post was my appointment of Deryck 
Maughan as Chief Operating Officer of Salomon Brothers Inc. He, along with the 
management of Phibro, join me in a pledge to make Salomon Inc a company that 
produces superior results for clients, employees and owners. 
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